
Question
Are WNBA players being paid fairly? Does performance
play a factor in the wage gap?

Comparison of WNBA and NBA Base Salary
One of the Largest Examples of Gender Pay Gap
Performance Metrics on Individual Basis for Top 100
Earners in Both Leagues

Methods
Multiple Regression Equations to Compare Impact of
Performance on Salary in Each League
Equations:

where  is the top 100 players, , and
 includes the performance metrics,

Below are figures that show the relationship between base
salary and important performance metrics.

Figure 1: WNBA Salary by Scoring Metrics

Figure 2: NBA Salary by Scoring Metrics

Regression Model Estimates

Dependent variable:

log(Base_Salary)
WNBA NBA

FGM 0.009* -0.022

(0.005) (0.035)

3P% 0.001 -0.012**

(0.003) (0.005)

REB -0.001 -0.001
(0.001) (0.0003)

AST 0.004*** 0.001***

(0.001) (0.0004)

BLK 0.002 0.004**

(0.006) (0.002)

STL -0.003 -0.004**

(0.005) (0.002)

PF -0.011*** -0.002*

(0.003) (0.001)

PTS 0.012
(0.017)

Constant 11.399*** 17.249***

(0.129) (0.149)

Observations 100 100

R2 0.350 0.452

Adjusted R2 0.243 0.354

Residual Std. Error 0.402 (df = 85) 0.301 (df = 84)

F Statistic 3.276*** (df = 14; 85) 4.623*** (df = 15; 84)

Note: p<0.1; p<0.05; p<0.01

As you can see, WNBA players are being paid much less
despite performing at a similar level as NBA players.

This method was chosen because it allows for comparison
of performance from the top 100 highest paid athletes in
both the WNBA and NBA based on factors that are
statistically related to the level of pay.

Data
The data for Figure 1 was compiled from Across the
Timeline’s “WNBA Stat Finder”, Basketball Reference’s
“WNBA Statistics and History”, and Spotrac’s “WNBA
Rankings”.

The data for Figure 2 was compiled from ESPN’s “NBA
Player Salaries - 2021-2022” and “NBA Player Stat
Leaders, 2021-2022 Regular Season”.

Additional resources used for qualitative purposes are listed
to the right.

Results
The table above shows the regression model estimates that
indicate the relationship between variables and ultimately,
the value of pay per league.

The results indicate that assists, a statistic attributed to the
ability to create scoring opportunities for teammates, is

significantly related to salary in both the WNBA and the
NBA.

The playing style of women’s basketball often focuses on
performing as unit whereas the playing style of men’s
basketball typically takes a “superstar” approach.

Conclusion
The takeaway from this research is on basis of performance
alone, WNBA players are not being compensated fairly in
comparison to NBA players. This means the gender pay gap
present in professional basketball is not related to the
players’ job performance, rather the external environment.
Possible explanations to this matter are sexism/misogyny,
low fan interest, and a lack of support and investment.
Unfortunately, this pay gap affects more than just WNBA
players, but female athletes at all levels of basketball by
reflecting that women are not valued in sports.
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logSalaryi,j = βXi + ϵi,

i j = {WNBA or NBA}
Xi
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